
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Thursday, June 1, 2017 6:53 PM 
To: Linda Mar 
Cc: Seth Lloyd 
Subject: Re: Funds to MIT 

great news 
thank you 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jun 1, 2017, at 2:49 PM, Linda Mar =rote: 

Dear =ichard, 
I am pleased =o confirm we have received the wire. We will credit the gift to =rofessor Lloyd's account. 

Thank you for =our support of MIT. 

Linda Mar 
Associate Director, Fund =nformation 
Office of the Recording Secretary 
Massachusetts Institute of =echnology 

From: Richard Kahn 
Date: Thursday • 
To: Seth Lloyd 
Cc: Linda Mar < 
Subject: Re: 

thank you 
we are sending wire now 
please confirm once =eceived 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jun 1, 2017, at 11:17 AM, =eth Lloyd > > wrote: 

Dear Richard, 

I am putting you in touch with =inda Mar, who was working with 'n this donation. 

Thanks, 

Seth 

Dear 

I would be =leased to assist you in the generous gift to support Professor =loyd. If you are issuing a 
check, you may send it to: 

MIT Office of =he Recording Secretary 
Massachusetts Institute of Technology 

If you wish to =emit the funds by wire, you may fund instructions here:https://giving.mit.edu/wire-
transfers. 

Please =eference the Lloyd Research Support Fund on any communications =egarding the gift. 
I note that past gifts have been recorded anonymously and we will continue to honor this =equest. 

Please let me =now if you have any further questions. 
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Thank you for =our support of Professor Lloyd's research at MIT. 

Linda =ar 

Associate =irector, Fund Information 

Office of the =ecording Secretary 

Massachusetts =nstitute of Technology 

t 11:13 =M, Richard Kahn 
<mailto wrote: 

Can you please send me check or =iring instructions. Thank you. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

and by Uncle =am. 

On Jun 1, 2017, at 11:07 AM, Seth Lloyd <a> wrote: 

With gratitude in return. =nbsp; 

Seth 

P.S. the reason for doing this =ia MIT as a gift is to minimize the fraction taken by MIT 

I did some research: this route =ill save about 30%. 

On Thu, Jun 1, 2017 at 9:20 AM, =effrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
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send 125 k to mit for =eth lloyd from gratitude, 

please =ote 
The information contained in =his communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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