From: Ann Rodriguez {_}

Sent: Friday, March 31, 2017 1:37 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Sylvester: Vacation

2 weeks vacation for Sylvester after taxes would be 51,416.36

Ann R.

On Mar 31, 2017, at 9:20 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

Meed dollar figures always. Thx

> wrote:

Hey Bossman,

Sylvestor is requesting 10 days vacation from 4/10-4/26. He thought that he was getting vacation pay as
well but Una said that he's not entitled to any paid vacation until 2018.

Sylvester was an independent contractor from March 2015- October 2016. We put him on payroll
October 2016

Would you like for us to give him vacation pay? or wait until 20187

Please advise,
Ann R.
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