
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Wednesday, May 27, 2015 9:49 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Reefco 

Nothing as yet. 
Dave at Reefco hasn't sent Rich an invoice as yet, because he's also waiting on an invoice for 2 inferred lights that need 
to be installed into the air handler. 

Ann R. 

On May 27, 2015, at 5:10 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

ok„ what did reefco do about the library mold in the air vent 

On Wed, May 27, 2015 at 4:24 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
<mailto >  wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

We might have to bring everything over to the Island tomorrow morning piece by piece. 

Ann R. 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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