
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 12:50 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: ?? 

Easy, but we can not waste time! 

I can have lawyer on the phone to Agree SPA 

Where are you going to do the work? 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 

From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: Monday, 24 November 2014 07:44 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: ?? 

no real issue except practicality we have thanksgigi=vg until dec 1 and then xmas starting the 15th, ill ask =ilots et al 

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 8:41 AM, Alireza Ittihad=eh 
<mailto:  > wrote: 

No, February wouldn't work for this size discount, in sellers mind. </=iv> 

We can easily close by December 21st, a Full Bill pre purchase takes 10 days= 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 

From: jeffrey E. 
Sent: Monday, 24 November 2014 07:39 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: ?? 

you can have your deposit asap. however&=bsp; with holidays dec would be difficult. feb 1 ok 

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 8:14 AM, Alireza Ittihad=eh 

cmailt°O > wrote: 

He is screeming, h=wever, he has agreed to your $25,250,000 as long as it is closed in Decemb=r. 
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<1=> 

Would you please i=sert this number into the LOI sign and return for my signature please</=> 

<1=> 

As Ever<=u> 

Alireza<=u> 

<1=> 

qp> 

From: jeffre= E. (mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 11:35 AM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: Re: ?? 

to get it done and only because i know how hard you =ave tried as you said your commission was 
250k&nbs=; so i will pay it above the 25 net to your seller. for a tota= of 25.25. . please don't ask me to come up. i 
wont.<=u> 

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 7:02 AM, Alireza Ittihadieh =lt, 
<mailto: > wrote: 

LOI is complete, O=LY price. 

<1=> 

Please agree to $2=M and be done with this. 

<1=> 

I also would like =o discuss the interior refurb with you as I want it to go smoothly.=u> 

</a 

As Ever<=u> 

Alireza<=u> 

<=a> 

From: jeffre= E. (mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> I 
Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 10:58 AM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
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Subject: Re: ?? 

i thought the contract was complete. is there any ot=er issue besides price? 

On Mon, Nov 24, 2014 at 6:55 AM, Alireza Ittihadieh =It 
<mailto: > wrote: 

The AD is not due =or 4 years, there is a lead time of 2 years for the Parts. 

</a 

I am in NY till We=nesday and wondered if there is any update from your side. 

</=> 

As Ever<=u> 

Alireza<=u> 

=/span> 

From: jeffre= E. (mailto:jee=acation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, November 24, 2014 10:24 AM 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: ?? 

http://www. nyti mes.com/2014/10/01/business/faa-tel is-airli nes-t=-replace-some-boei ng-cockpit-
displays.htm I <http://www.nytimes.com/2014/10/01/busines=/faa-tells-airlines-to-replace-some-boeing-cockpit-
displays.html> 

please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please no=e 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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