
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, December 9, 2015 4:51 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: STC accounting invoice 
Attachments: 20151203103439824.pdf; Untitled attachment 00022.htm; 20151203103445439.pdf; 

Untitled attachment 00025.htm 

please advise if ok to pay Alan's October 2015 =ccounting invoice in the amount of 18,050 thank =ou 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>David Hasson c

Subject: =/b>Fwd: southern =nvoices 

Date: =/b>December 3, 2015 at 12:37:47 PM =ST 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn

Hi Rich, 

Here is =he October billing. 
Hope you are well and are =njoying this time of year. 

We should begin =ooking at the January estimate. 

Best, 

D 

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE =martphone 

EFTA_R1_01333268 
EFTA02353079



  Original =essage 
From: Cindy LLBiz 
Date: 12/03/2015 11:06 AM (GMT-05:00) 
To: David =asson 
Subject: southern =nvoices 

 Original Message 
From: scanner 
Sent: Thursday, December 3, 2015 10:35 AM 
To: =indy LIBiz 
Subject: Message from "RNP00267349D69A" 

This E-mail was sent from "RNP00267349D69A" =Aficio MP 2852). 

Scan Date: 12.03.2015 =0:34:39 (-0500) 
Queries to: 

2 
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