
From: Ann Rodriquez 
Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 6:15 PM 
To: Cecile de Jongh 
Cc: Jeffrey; Erika Kellerhals 
Subject: Re: Great St. James - Cistern 

Yes, He's sending a revised copy with $=,600.00 as Architectural fee. 

Ann R. 

On May 17, 2=16, at 2:00 PM, Cecile de Jongh < 

Anna, 

> wrote: 

Look at the last page. =He says that the contract is for a total of $3,800, but then says that ther= will be a first 
payment of $1,800 and a final payment of $1,soo.=nbsp; That's $3,600 not $3,800. Which is it? 

With warm regards, 

Cecile 

<=iy dir="ltr"> On Tuesday, May 17, 2016 1:=4 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Please advise if we should proceed with Mr. Mc Clean? 
=div id="yiv0012462304AppleMailSignature"> 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

<=div> 

From: Jermaine McClea 

Reply-To: Jermaine McClean 
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Good day Anna, 

Please see the attached f=le for your perusal. Additionally, a copy of the deed to the property must 
a=company the permit application along with a CZM package from Cadastral whic= will cost approximately $145. 

Cordially, 

Jermaine E. McClean 
Architect 
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