From: Richard Kahn <l -

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 5:03 PM

To: Jeffrey Epstein

Subject: Fwd: invoice

Attachments: Invoice JE-1403-1815.pdf; Untitled attachment 00194.htm

attached is scott's first invoice in the amount of 150.00?
is it =k to pay?
which entity NES, JEE personal should we use to =ay?

Richard =ahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

301 East 66th Street, Suite =0F
New York, NY 10065
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Scott Denett _

Date: June 17, 2011 =:27:05 AM EDT
To: Richard Kahn < i
ce: [

Subject: invoice
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