
From: Barry J. Cohen 
Sent: Wednesday, August 9, 2017 11:56 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: The bust 

100 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 9, 2017, at 7:02 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gm=il.com» wrote: 

What value did you get for bust 

On Wed, Aug 9, 2017 at 6:52 PM Barry J. Cohen wrote: 

You mean, when we value something at "costR=1; do we include the sales tax paid at the time of 
purchase?=/p> 

Raised bid to $11.65MM. We countered at $12MM.=nbsp; They asked for $300K deposit instead of 
$500K. We're tel=ing them that's ok. 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:je=vacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Wednesday Au ust 09 2017 6:50 PM 
To: Barry J. Cohe 
Subject: Re: The bust 

ok, is that with sales tax included. &nbs=; also did the plane loi come back 

On Wed Au 9 2017 at 6:29 PM, Barry J. Cohen « 
target=" wrote: 

I told you that Christie raised the vale up to the b=sis. I was wrong. Valuation is $25.2MM 
below basis.<=u> 

Barry J. Cohen = I 
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Elysium Management,=LLC 

445 Park Avenue Suite 1401 

New York, NY 10022&=bsp; 

Tel. 

please no=e 
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