From: richard ahr

Sent: Thursday, October 22, 2015 3:39 PM
To: Lauren Leiman

Cc: Brad Wechsler

Subject: Re: Martin Nowak

ok

thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

Hi Richard,

Just want to let you know the wire was sent yesterday. They should have the funds today.
Best,

Lauren

Lauren C. Leiman

wrote:

attached are wire instructions which are the same from Dec 2014
please advise when wire is sent
thank you

Name of Bank: Bank of America
Bank Address: 100 Federal Street Boston MA 02110

{President and Fellows of Harvard College RSO Acc)
Wire Details: For Sole Use and Benefit of the Program for Evolutionary Dynamics, Harvard Fund Number
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Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

access to them?

On Oct 14, 2015, at 12:36 PM, Lauren Leima_

wrote:

Hi Richard,

Hope you are well. We have requested the wire instructions for the payment. Do you have

We are ready to send the wire as soon as we receive the instructions.
Thank you,

Lauren

Lauren C. Leiman

Elysium Management LLC

From: Richard Kahn lmailt_

Sent: Wednesday, October 14, 2015 12:16 PM
To: Brad Wechsler
Cc: Lauren Leiman
Subject: Re: Martin Mowak

please advise if you have any updates

2
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thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.

On Oct 7, 2015, at 3:31 PM, Brad Wechsler _

Rich-let me track it down. Who was the donee?

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

rrom:uchors ka1 |

Date: Tue, 6 Oct 2015 19:34:11 -0400

Subject: Martin Nowak

Please advise if remaining 1,000,000 was sent.

Thank you
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Rich

From: Martin NowaK [

Date: Wednesday, September 30, 2015 at 3:55 PM

Dear Richard

Thank you so much for the great support of our program by the Leon Black Foundation.
Last year you kindly sent us 4M of the 5M pledge.

The letter said that you would send the remaining 1M by end of September 2015. Is this
correct?

Many thanks and best wishes

Martin
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