From: sela Kiein <

Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2017 2:08 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
Subject: Re: CT Corp EA

ves to Education Advance
Thank you,

Bella

Tel:

On May 4, 2017, at 10:06 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

yes

On Thu, May 4, 2017 at 9:40 AM, =ella Klein <||| > v ot-:

Jeffrey,

Attached=please find CT Corp invoice for Education Advance filing in the amount =f $575.60. Please
advise on payment entity:

1.Education Advance

2. Enhanced =ducation

3. DKI

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:
from: =/v> L I
Subject: =/b>Re: CT Corp =A

Date: =/b>May 3, 2017 at 9:14:03 PM EDT
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To: =/b>Bella Kiein <[ G-

Thank you Bella,

| think | should pay for =t from Education Advance account (controlled by me). Will you please
=guble check with JE just in case?

On Wed, May 3, 2017 at 3:27 PM =ella Klein <|||| |

<mailto - > wrote:

Hi
Attached=please find CT Corp invoice for Education Advance. Please confirm =ith JE
who is paying it

Thank you,
Bella

Tel: <tel: (I

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b- |

Date: =/b=May 3, 2017 at 3:17:14 PM EDT

To: =/

CS 3051ci
[00:17:c8:25:f3:53]

The information contained in =his communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

. =/font>
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please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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