
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2013 4:33 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: outstanding invoice 
Attachments: epstein.EPS.003.2.02.22.13.pdf; Untitled attachment 00149.htm 

I received a nasty call from Jeff Sternhell asking =hy invoice has not been paid Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 =exington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeff Sternhell" =It 

Date: May 28, 2013 12:24:33 PM EDT 

To: "Richard Kahn" _-

Cc: < 

Subject: outstanding invoice 

<=a» 

Richard: 
Once again I've attached the final invoice for the work =ompleted back in Feb on the 6th floor media room. It's 

=een 3 months since we've completed the contracted scope and would =ppreciate payment. On a side note I've 
instructed Richard Barnett to =un the media room's system at least once a week to insure that it =oesn't go into a stand 
by or hibernate state, I have not heard back =rom him in months so I'm confident that the system is working as 
=ntended. 

Best 
Jeff 

Jeff Sternhell 
Vice =resident 
Cutting Ed e =ystems 
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