
From: richardkaha 
Sent: Monday, March 5, 2012 10:19 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Re: VI Gunite Pools 

Yes - Per 2012 agreements we owe 14k on main pool and 30k on flagpole (2 payments of 15k) totaling 44k 

Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Mon, S Mar 2012 17:11:21 -0500 
To: Richard Kahn< 
Subject: Re: VI Gunite Pools 

does this mean we owe them 45k ? 

On Mon, Mar 5, 2012 at 4:28 PM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

attached is a summary of all payments made per original and 2012 agreements 
total paid to VI Gunite was 392,416.99 

i am still compiling pool related expenses paid by LSJ but wanted you to have summary tonight 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite 10F 
New York, NY 10065 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 

Date: March 5, 2012 3:51:45 PM EST 

To: 

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 

EFTA_R1_01357431 
EFTA02363852



Reply To.  rn> 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of Jeffrey Epstein Unauthorized 
use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you 
have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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