From: cotom, olivier <|| G-

Sent: Monday, January 18, 2016 3:16 PM
To: ‘jeffrey E.
Subject: RE: Re:

You're not sure she will keep the deal ? She is supposed to offer me the deal...

De : jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] Envoyé : lundi 18 janvier 2016 16:15 A : COLOM, Olivier Objet : Re: Re:

you should put in writing the deal and have her sign it.

On Mon, Jan 18, 2016 at 10:13 AM, coLom, olivier < | || |GG - - ot-:

Should not we agree on a story before | suddenly disappear ? Everybody will wonder.. and understand. | can be away
next few days though, it will help

On the financials, to be totally sure:
- | get paid till summer

- Then as | go, from summer 2016 to summer 2018, and in addition to the salaries perceived in 2016 till summer, |
am being paid 1.5 over the 2 years

De : jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> | Envoyé : lundi 18 janvier 2016 16:06 A
: COLOM, Olivier Objet : Re: Re:

your agreement is that you work from home . get paid unti summer get 750 k. per yera for two years.  IF you like send
her a note to confirm this ..

On Mon, Jan 18, 2016 at 10:04 AM, coLom, Olivier < - > ot
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Did they say that ?

De : jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> | Envoyé : lundi 18 janvier 2016 16:02 A
: COLOM, Olivier Objet : Re: Re:

you should go home. not be in the office.

On Mon, Jan 18, 2016 at 9:58 AM, COLOM, Olivier > wrote:

Don't want to change the deal...but really!!

De : jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> | Envoyé : lundi 18 janvier 2016 15:58 A
: COLOM, Olivier Objet : Re: Re:

if you want to change the deal , you can try., ithink they will fire you immediately. and then the longer term
problem will be great.

2016-01-18 9:52 GMT-05:00 coLom, Olivier < (G - -

| checked and what they owe me in bonus decided in 2015 for year 2014 is actually :

235,000 euros

To be paid in 3 : March 2016, March 2017, March 2018.

| can't accept to lose all. It would be unfair considering also that | had to borrow 100.000 euros to pay my tax 2 months
ago - simply because they forgot to warn me that this amount of 235,000 euros (257.000 euros brutto) would not be
paid in 2015 but differed...

What is earned is earned. But of course the differed parts to be paid in 2017 and 2018 are something else, as | will no
longer be on payroll at that time
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De : jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> | Envoyé : lundi 18 janvier 2016 13:02 A
: COLOM, Olivier Objet : Re:

I - o

2016-01-18 6:37 GMT-05:00 COLOM, Olivier {_} >:

Can | call you today ?

<http://medianet.edmond-de-rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/img/ecoattitude. gif=

Ensemble adoptons des gestes responsables : N'imprimez ce mail que si nécessaire,

Ce message et ses annexes sont strictement confidentiels et établis & I"attention exclusive des destinataires prévus par
I'expediteur. 5i vous n'étes pas le destinataire de ce message, nous vous remercions de le détruire immeédiatement et
d'en avertir I'expéditeur. Toute utilisation ou diffusion non autorisée de ce message et de ses annexes est interdite. Tout
message electronique est susceptible d'altération et son intégrité ne peut étre assurée,

Edmond de Rothschild (France) ne pourra étre tenu pour responsable des erreurs ou omissions contenues dans ce
message, Ce message ne constitue en aucun cas un engagement de Edmond de Rothschild (France), sous réserve de tout
accord par écrit entre vous et Edmond de Rothschild (France). Conformément a la Loi Informatique et Libertés, n*78-17
du 6 juillet 1978, modifiée par la loi n®2004-801 du 6 aodt 2004, toute personne a le droit d'interroger Edmond de
Rothschild (France) en vue de savoir si les traitements automatisés dont il dispose contiennent des informations
nominatives la concernant, les faire rectifier ou les faire supprimer.

Francais <http://medianet.edmond-de-rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_fr.html> | English
<http://medianet.edmond-de-rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_en.html> | Italiano <http://medianet.edmond-
de-rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_it.html> | Deutsch <http://medianet.edmond-de-
rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_de.html> | Espafiol <http://medianet.edmond-de-
rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_es.html> | Chinese <http://medianet.edmond-de-
rothschild.fr/edr/disclaimer/disclaimer_cn.html>

Edmond de Rothschild (France) - tous droits réservés
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please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. Itis the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com= , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
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received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee, It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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