
From: Richard Kah 
Sent: Friday, July 12111.11 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: LSJ Cleaning Crew 

do want crew working on heavy equipment garage next week? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: =/b>Ann Rodrique 

Subject: =/b>Re: L.S1 Cleaning =rew 

Date: =/b>luly 21, 2016 at 8:25:22 PM =DT 

To: =/b>Richard Kahn 

Cc: Daphne Wallace 

Hey Rich, 

Cleaning crew on GSJ to clean-out and put back in items in =he Shed. 

Requesting: $2,400.00 
This week 7/18-22/16 
4guys, 5days (Mon - Fri) =br class=""> 
Notes: I'll have them clean out the Heavy =quipment garage next week (July 25th-29th) this will be there last 

;reek. 

Ann R. 
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GSJ shed. 

On Jul =5, 2016, at 3:03 PM, Richard Kahn 

ok 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK=Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 

On Jul 15 2016, at 2:47 =M, Ann Rodriquez 
wrote: 

rote: 

7/12-16/16 not paid 
(Check will be held until =aturday) 

7/6-11/16 PAID 

Notes: We're going to need them for two more weeks to do the =eavy Machinery garage and 

Ann =. 

On =ul 15, 2016, at 2:36 PM, Richard Kahn <richardkahn12@gmail.com> wrote: 

pictures looked great 
how many days have they =orked already? 
does it require 4 more 
if so =hen ok 
thanks 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
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On Jul =4, 2016, at 10:18 PM, Ann Rodriquez 
wrote: 

Hey Rich, 

Cleaning crew on LSJ =o clean-out and put back items in Cost-U-Less, the Wreck 
shop and the =unnel. 

Requesting: $2,400.00 
This week 7/12-16/16 
4guys, 5days (Tuesday to =aturday) 

Notes: I believe this is there =ast week but I'll double check with Bossman and 
send you pics =omorrow. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

On Jul 8, 2016, at 10:51 AM, Richard Kahn =1 
<mailto:  wrote: 

Ok. Thank you. Please send photos to jee and I. Thank you. =br class=""> 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Jul 8, 2016, at 10:35 =M, Ann Rodrique 
wrote: 

Hey Rich, 

Bossman asked that I =et cleaning guys to come out to LSJ as soon as possible to 
clean-out =nd put back items in Cost-U-Less, the Wreck shop and the Tunnel. He =greed to $3,000.00 for 5 workers for 5 
days (7/6-7/10) =ednesday-Sunday? 

Please issue check to Mr. =eff Poleon 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 
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