
From: Jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Sent: Frida Ma 1 2009 11:46 AM 
To: 
Subject: Re: confirmation of payment for publication - thank you 

Call me or 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 1, 2009, at 3:58 PM, =wrote: 

> See below. Publication on its way. 

> Sent from my BlackBerryA• wireless handheld 

> Original Message 
> From: "Parker, Stephen" 

> Date: Fri 1 Ma 200913:32:46 
> To: 
> Cc: Parker, Stephen 
> Subject: RE: confirmation of payment for publication - thank you 

> Yes, we received the payment. You took the subscription in your name, 
> but then told us to send it to the organization. Therefore, they are 
> listed as the subscriber who receives the issues. 

> At any rate, please do let them know that the first issue they will => receive will arrive in June (that is the normal 
date). 

> SJ P 

> Or' • inal Massa :e---
> From: 
> Sent: Fri 5/1/2009 1:11 PM 
> To: Parker, Stephen 
> Subject: Re: confirmation of payment for publication - thank you 

> The check was from me but the address of the recipient is The Florida 
> Science Foundation. Does this help? 

> Many thanks 
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> Sent from my BIackBerryA° wireless handheld 

> Original Message 
> From: "Parker, Stephen" 

> Date: Fri, 1 May 2009 12:34:54 
> To: 
> Cc: Parker, Step en 
> Subject: RE: confirms ion o payment for publication - thank you 

> The situation is not clear. Was the subscription in your name, 
> lor was it for someone else or for some organization? 
> I do not have a record of a subscription that goes out to you -- that 
> is, in your name. So if it is in your name, please confirm this and I 
> will recheck over everything again. And do give me the address to 
> which subscription copies were to go. 

> As for your question, assuming you have paid, the first copy you 
> will receive is when the upcoming spring issue appears. 
> Subscription is only by the calendar year (spring and fall issues). 

> Stephen Parker 
> Editor, The Nabokovian 

> Or' • 
> From: 
> Sent: n • 
> To: Parker, Stephen 
> Subject: confirmation of payment for publication - thank you 

> Hello, 

> I subscribed to your twice yearly publication about one month ago and 
> sent in a check. Could you please confirm that you received it. 
> Also, does one receive an immediate copy of last publication? So far, 
> we have received nothing. 

> Thank you for your time, 

> mail2web - Check your email from the web at 
> http://link.mail2web.com/mail2web 
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> <winmail.dat> 
<?xml version=.0" encoding=TF-8"?> 
<!DOCTYPE plist PUBLIC "-//Apple//DTD PLIST 1.0//EN" "http://www.apple.com/DTDs/Propertylist-1.0.dtd"> 
<plist version=.0"> 
<dict> 

<key>date-last-viewed</key> 
<integer>0</integer> 
<key>date-received</key> 
<integer>1241264721</integer> 
<key>flags</key> 
<integer>8590195713</integer> 
<key>gmail-label-ids</key> 
<array> 

<integer>21</integer> 
</array> 
<key>original-mailbox</key> 
<string>imap://jeevacation@imap.gmail.com/%5BGmail%5D/All%20Mail</string> 
<key>remote-id</key> 
<string>18992</string> 

</dict> 
</plist> 
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