From: David Mitche!l

Sent: Thursday, January 5, 2017 11:50 AM
To: jeffrey E.

Cc: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re:

They will release after three stabilized months of operations

But the payment back sooner is most likely f=om the condo warehouse loan or sales at 320 east 82

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
801 Madison Avenue

New York NY 10065
USA

!jmgmitc!el !nldings..cumcf::- <mailto:djm@mitchellholdings.com>

On Jan 5, 2017, at 6:28 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gm=il.com> > wrote:

also, when will db release the 750 back to you/

On Wed, Jan 4, 2017 at 5:19 PM, David Mitchell <=pan dir="Itr"> <djm@mitch=llholdings.com
<mailto:djm@mitchellholdings.com> > wrote:

Much thanks for the time this morning and the friendly career directio=
| value you input grea=Ily

DAVID MITCHELL
Mitchell Holdings LLC
201 Madison Avenue

New York NY 10065
UsA

!jmgmwc:e |!D|!|ng5.mm <mali to:!jmgmwchelIhﬂldings..cum:»
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please note

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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