
From: Eileen Alexanderson < 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 8:22 PM 
To: jeeyacation@omail.com' 
Subject: Fw: 2010 TRA Payment 

From: Elliot Becker 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 04:21 PM Eastern Standard Time 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: Re: 2010 TRA Payment 

In 2015 as part of the 2014 tra payment. 

Elliot Becker 

On May 14, 2013, at 4:09 PM, "Eileen Alexanderson" < 
<mailto > wrote: 

Hello Elliot, on pg 3 of the attached I see 25% deferral. The 5-1 says it was deferred for 4 years. Please tell me-
does that mean it will get paid in 2014 or in 2015 (as part of the 2014 TRA)? 

Thanks. 

From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 3:32 PM 
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' 
Subject: FW: 2010 TRA Payment 
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From: Vincent Maniscalco 
Sent: Monday, April 04, 20116:24 PM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Cc: Elliot Becker; Wendy F. Dulman 
Subject: 2010 TRA Payment 

Eileen: 

Please see the attached with regards to the 2010 TRA payment. We are scheduled to make the payment 
tomorrow on Tuesday April 5th. Please contact us should you have any questions. 

Regards, 

Vincent Maniscalcol Apollo Management 
(Fax) 

<2010 TRA Payment Support 3-28-2011 - Leon.pdf> 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they 
are addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or 
other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the sender and delete the material from 
any computer. 

Apollo Global Management, LLC 
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