
From: Kathy Ruemmler 
Sent: Tuesday, December 29, 2015 12:50 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

Of course. 

Sent from my i=ad 

On Dec 29, 2015, at 7:29 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

no not at all. . = On another note I would love to see your version of washington=one day , if possible CIA or 
NSA or boy stuff. 

On Tue, Dec 29, 2015 at 7=25 AM, Kathy Ruemmle 
  wrote:<=r> 

Does that change you= view on offering 6? 

Sent from my iPad 

On Dec 2=, 2015, at 6:07 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
wrote: 

they paid approx 6.2 for the apt. t=ey probaly have another 300=400k in it . they bought a small 2= 6 m 
house in calif . 

please note 

The informa=ion contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-cli=nt privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only f=r 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized=use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is s=rictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
comm=nication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e=mail to jeevacat=on@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,=br>including all attachments. copyright -all rights 

reserved 
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&nb=p; please note 

The information contained in this commun=cation is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
consti=ute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying o= this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and ma= be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com> , and 
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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