Sent: Tuesday, December 25, :

To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

i need to ask May
everything that PED can do has to go via Harvard pay roll thus the person has to be appointed in the system etc

i will also talk to joscha

On Dec 28, 2015, at 8:46 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com> > wrote:

but cant you just give him a stipend to visit if i send yo= the money

On Mon, Dec 28, 2015 at 8:38 PM, Nowak, Martin <=pan dir="ltr"_

i think last year this was done via media lab (MIT)

it might not work via harvard

{because joscha is not paid from harvard)

On Dec 28, 2015, at 5:49 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacat=on@gmail.com> >
wrote:

rich please send ped 50k from gratitude to ped to be=paid to josha

please note
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