
From: Lvjet 
Sent: Wednesday, December 30, 2015 12:44 AM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 
Subject: Re: G550 Serial 5070 

that would be great! I could really use them! 
thanks so much again 
larry 

 Original Message 
From: Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski 
Sent: Tue, Dec 29, 2015 7:18 pm 
Subject: Re: G550 Serial 5070 

there a both tvs and computers on the island . perfect for your new house 

On Tue, Dec 29, 2015 at 7:06 PM, Larry Visoski > wrote: 

From Joe 
I will keep on him to get a response 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Joseph L. Carfagna Jr." 
Date: December 29, 2015 at 5:52:09 PM EST 
To: Larry Visoski < 
Subject: Re: G550 Serial 5070 

Larry, 

Thanks. I will be in touch as soon as I know they have this message. 

Joe Carfagna, Jr. 
President, Leading Edge Aviation Solutions, LLC 
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Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 29, 2015, at 5:32 PM, Larry Visoski wrote: 

Joe, 

respectfully, the plane has sat for over a year. If she wants to fix it, as I said we will pay her the 
$20m. The unknowns are just that unknown. We will have to pay the $1.2M to bring it on rolls royce care and easy 
couple of hundred thousands for any problem with landing gear. etc. 

Let me know, 

Best, 

Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 29, 2015, at 5:00 PM, Joseph L. Carfagna Jr. < 
wrote: 
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Larry, 

I can convey the message but do you feel that there could be $2,500,000 risk at stake 
taking it without the current overdue maintenance completed? 

Joe Carfagna, Jr. 

President, Leading Edge Aviation Solutions, LLC 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 29, 2015, at 4:45 PM, Larry Visoski <Ivjet@aol.com 
<mailto:Ivjet@aol.com» wrote: 

Hi Joe, 

please tell Mrs. Sabadash that we will either buy the plane with full 
airworthiness maintenance and certificate for $20 million or "as is where is" and close in ten days for $17.5M and the 
risk is ours. 

Thank you, 
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Larry Visoski 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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