
From: ann rodriquez 
Sent: Thursday, May 28, 2015 9:31 PM 
To: jeffrey E.; Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

I was thinking maybe, Pokey can build cabine=s out of wood instead of the Kalamzoo cabinets and drawers? Just a 
thought= I would need for him to give us a quote. 

-Sylvester said he could fix the existing cabine=s and draws. 

Weber Grill like the one at the Main Compound: $1,900.00 hatp://www.homedepot.com/p/Weber-Summit-S-470-4-
Burner-Propane-Gas-Grill-in-=tainless-Steel-7170001/202331861?N=5yclvZbxazZlIs 
chttp://www.homedepot.com/p/Weber-Summit-S-470=4-Burner-Propane-Gas-Grill-in-Stainless-Steel-
7170001/202331861?N=SyclvZ=xazZlIs> 
=br> 
G=s Range stove: $2,520.00 
http://www.homedepot.com/p/GE-6-7=cu-ft-Double-Oven-Gas-Range-with-Self-Cleaning-Convection-Oven-in-Stainles=-
Steel-CGS990SETS5/202976828 <http://www.=omedepot.com/p/GE-6-7-cu-ft-Double-Oven-Gas-Range-with-Self-
Cleaning-Conve=tion-Oven-in-Stainless-Steel-CGS990SETSS/202976828> 

We found some engines for 8K - 10K each, I sp=ke to Rich this afternoon about the engines and we both agreed that we 
sho=ld get some input from Boscoe before proceeding. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privi=eged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If 
you are not the inten=ed recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution=or duplication of this 
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have r=ceived this communication in error, please notify the sender 
immedia=ely and delete all copies. 

On Thursday, May 28, 2015 4:39 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmai=.com> wrote: 

tiki hut kitcehn price?? =nbsp; recore re manuf or new engines for barge? price. 

please note 

The=information contained in this communication is confidential, may be att=rney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is inten=ed only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE U=authorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part=thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
receive= this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return=e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacati=n@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof,=br>including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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