From: ric Roth <[ N

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 6:22 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: RE: New HD Monitor - Fwd L/H cabin Bulkhead

It will not be high definition, but it should be brighter and a bit sharper. It also provides the opportunity to provide HD if
you ever run an HDMI or other high definition input. The existing one has been in there for a while = no telling when it
might go.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

I .. cor

<http://www.intljet.com/> <http://twitter.com/#!/intljet> <http://www.facebook.com/intljet>

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 2:06 PM

Subject: Re: New HD Monitor - Fwd L/H cabin Bulkhead
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Will it be a sharper image

On Wed, Jul 12, 2017 at 1:02 PM Eric Roth _ > wrote:

Good afternoon leffrey,
Below is the cost for a new Rosen HD monitor.

210 Entertainment System 5 20,690

Remove and discard existing monitor from the fwd L/H bulkhead. Procure and install one (1) new Rosen High
Definition wide format monitor using existing audio / video wiring.

Best Regards,

Eric

ERIC H. ROTH | PRESIDENT

<http://www.intjet.com P/ twItter.com;/#1] Intlje p://WWW.TaceDook.com/intljet>

2221 Smithtown Avenue, Long Island MacArthur Airport, Ronkonkoma, New York 11779
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please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee, It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to

jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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