From: Richard Kahn <
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2017 7:14 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Fwd: Antilles Schoal Tuition Due - _ October 6, 2017

please advise if ok to pay
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: =/b>Daphne Wallace _
Subject: =/b=Antilles School =uition Due _ - October 6, 2017

Date: =/b>0ctober &, 2017 at 3:10:28 PM =DT

Greetings Rich,
is respectfully requesting the payment of the balance due on =he annual tuition for his son
59,250.00 - 8th Grade tuition. This represents =0% of the tuition cost.

Previous amount sponsored =y JE for 7th Grade tuition was $8,875.00.
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