
From: ZM < 
Sent: Friday, September 1, 2017 12:11 AM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: ZM Mercedes 5500 

Confirmed 
Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Au= 31, 2017, at 6:04 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.c=m» wrote: 

yes 

On Thu, Aug 31, 2017 at 7:41 PM > wrote: 

The 5500 need its annual service a=ter your last visit, After picking the car up yesterday, the Airmatic 
Suspe=sion failed. 

th= right rear strut has a bad leak, which caused the Airmatic pump to fail4=iv> 
Mercedes of ABQ a=e proposing replacing both rear Airmatic struts and pump for a cost of = 
$9077.39 
=div class="gmail_default" style="font-size:small"> 

Regards 

= please note 

The information contained in t=is communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may=br>constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of th= addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or=copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited=br>and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error= please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, a=d 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all at=achments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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