
From: Lvjet < 
Sent: Wednesday, October 28, 2015 8:02 PM 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com; 
Subject: Re: Nautica 41' 

Jeffrey 
Ed informs he believes he will do the deal at $140k painted, new tubes, rear deck completed, new syth cork deck, 
engines operating, Generator installed and AC working. 
he's spoken to paint shop, and rear deck repair, only outstanding piece is new tubes,. he's getting his quote for FLL 
company and Novurina in Vero beach,. he needs to confirm all his quotes before committing to our deal. 

I'll keep on him 

thx 
Larry 

 Original Message 
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Ivjet a Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Wed, Oct 28, 2015 3:48 pm 

nautica? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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