From: Richard kahn

Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2015 4:50 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

2014 - 18,000 (all 4 quarterly payments of 4500 each)
2015 - 4,500 (Q1)

total owed =2,500

Richard Kahn

Mew ‘mri, NY 10022

tel
fax

cel

On Mar 24, 2015, at 12:46 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

how much rent does jean luc owe

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee, It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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