From: bellaklein <

Sent: Friday, January 8, 2015 2:44 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein
leffrey,

submitted her petty cash =eceipts for reimbursement in the amount of $1391.59. Please =pprove
reimbursement.

5415 =/span>5 hours driving course

$390 taxi, =ravel

$511.59 food at LSJ, PB, NY

560 =/span>driving class

515 :,-’sparn- bank wire transfer fee
51351.59 =/span>Total reimbursement requested

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:
Date: =/b>lanuary 8, 2015 at 6:17:43 PM =5T

Subject: =/b>Re: New =eceipts

Hi =ella,

| don't know how | counted 1,680 at the =eginning lol

But the total amount will be 1, 376 =nbsp;not 1,143.You didn't include recent the grocery shop: gourmet
=allery” at the Island for 5173.15 and an hour driving class for 560. | =ill attach those receipts in my next email. Thanks

P.5 please don't forget about 515 fee when you send a wire =)

on Thu,Jan 8, 2015 at 4:29 PM, belaklein <[ - - '
Hi [

Attached is your petty cash report in excel form with =ttached receipts that you submitted. | have 51143
for reimbursement =ith the driving package. Please confirm numbers.
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Thank you,
Bella

On Jan 7, 2015, at 12:45 PM, || <-> wrote:

Hi Bella,
As | said | finally got my =ands on doing this :)

Here are =eceipts for past months some of them very recent from my trips to Palm =each and
Island with Jeff] ve attached you a receipt with taxi =o JFK when | wasn't able to book a car to take me. It was
confirmed :ithﬁa\"nu can ask her she knows. Also | am attaching = receipt from an hour driving class before my
road test =xam. | am taking road test exam again by the end of this month as =effrey wants us all have license. 5o |
recently purchased 5 hours =ackage lessons which is 5415 they didn't give me any =lectronic receipts and | wasn't able
to come in person to purchase =ut you can check it here http://usonedrivingschool.com. The total amount is =1,680.47
plus 515 fee

I think | have =ore receipts from my travel and purchases to Palm beach with =_:| |
made using my card and some groceries for Lynn in =Y but | will send them next time. | am not sure where they are as =
just moved to new apt and haven't unpacked all my =oxes. Would you please make a reimbursement sometimes =oday
as its a big amount for me and | will need those money for my =ersonal purchases. Thanks !}

Sincerel
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