From: srad Wechsler |

Sent: Wednesday, January 14, 2015 8:21 PM
To: Jeffrey Epstein

Cc: Richard Joslin; Eileen Alexanderson
Subject: Re: Taxes

Hi- Jeffrey, Confirmed barry has the authority. (See below). Btw, its Idb 2=14, not 2011 (my error). We're teed up to
move the 55 but want to make cer=ain you're comfortable. B Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry

-----Original Message-----

From:

Date: Wed, 14 Jan 2015 19:59:49

To: leffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com>
Reply-To:

Cc: Richard Joslin{ N Ci'ccn Alexanderson<{ NS

Subject: Taxes

| believe we can have the full federal estimate paid tomorrow out of leon a=d deb's joint acct IF leon borrows 56mm out
of 512mm in ldb 2011 lle (own=d by the trusts). | am confirming | need one approval (barry cohen, mgr of=the lic). |
presume this is choice 1. Pls confirm. | assume choice 2, whil= not likely, is to pay the full 5$21mm federal estimate on
1/24 rather than=piecemeal it out. Correct? Pls call or email with observations or concerns= B Sent from my Verizon
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