
From: Richard Kahn < 
Sent: Tuesday, August 16, 2011 6:38 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: re: Gary Kerney Aug. invoice 
Attachments: INVOICE FOR AUGUST 19.docx; Untitled attachment 00361.htm 

Attached is Gary's August invoice in the amount of 24,295.40 Is it =k to pay? 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
301 East 66th Street, Suite =OF 
New York, NY 10065 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gary Kerney 

Date: August 11, 2011 =:27:37 PM EDT 

To: Rich Kah 
Subject: Aug. =nvoice 

Rich 

My landmark server is out ,using my gmail 

Attached please find my Aug. invoice 

Thanks 

Gary 
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