
From: bwechsler@imax.com 
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 5:11 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein; Leon Black 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

I spoke to leon and he said 8, not 10. I will get this in the works and call rich when I have a sense when it will go out. 
(Rich-will you reissue an invoice in the new amt.) Thx, b Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: bwechsler@imax.com 
Date: Sun, 23 Apr 2017 18:33:12 +0000 
To: Jeffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com> 
ReplyTo: bwechsler@imax.com 
Subject: Re: 

Ok 
Sent from my Verizon Wireless BlackBerry 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Sun, 23 Apr 2017 13:22:38 -0400 
To: Brad Wechsler<BWechsler@imax.com>; Leon Black<black@apollolp.com> 
Cc: Richard Kahn<richardkahn12@gmail.com> 
Subject: 

Brad spoke to Leon, friday night, he said if I wanted the 10 million invoice paid this week , he would do it, though he 
'd prefer to wait until end of may, I prefer it get paid before thurs this week , so please coordinate with rich kahn, thx 

please note 
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