From: Richard Kahn <

Sent: Thursday, August 10, 2017 8:28 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Fwd: JSC Interiors LLC

confirming that-will not go on J5C payroll as =riginally discussed

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:
Subject: =/b=Re: JSC Interiors =LC

Date: =/b>August 10, 2017 at 2:06:44 PM =DT

Hi Rich and =ella,

Hope =ou week is going well.

| am very sorry i =idn't mean to ignore but | thought that Jeffrey informed you about his =ecision to withhold
with the process of a payroll as he mentioned to =ake care of it. 5o as for now, | am waiting to hear from Jeffrey and =ill
let you know as soon as | do. Thank you

Sincerely,

On Fri, Aug 4, 2017 at 5:22 PM, =ichard Kah_ wrote:
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ok
thank =ou

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 =exington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

<maico -

rote:
Hi =ich,
My deep apologize for a delayed reply.

Thank you so much for this. | am currently =sraveling but will be back on Monday and will submit
all necessary =ocuments by then or by Tuesday the latest. Thank you and have a great =eekend!

Sincerely,

> wrote:

per jee you will begin =n JSC Interiors LLC payroll as of 8-7-2017 at 40,000 per year
you are paid every two weeks and we will need the following in order to =egin

1) work authorization - please send us papers or bring to office to =hotocopy
2) attached W-4 to be completed (bella or i can help you with =uestions)
3) copy of check with your preferred bank for direct deposit

please contact bella or i with any questions
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

EFTA_R1_01385079
EFTA02376061



EFTA_R1_01385080
EFTA02376062



