From: I

Sent: Friday, August 30, 2013 9:48 PM

To: Steve Hanson

Cc: <jeevacation@gmail.com>; c_:-
Subject: Re:

Mo we have not gone ahead with anything yet. We have not signed, paid deposit or commenced any work with her.

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 30, 2013, at 5:44 PM, “steve Hanson" <| N - > ~ote:

Thought it was done 2 weeks ago- that's what she said when | asked her-

Sent from Steve Hanson's Blackberry

Proud to be the first national multi-concept restaurant group to be certified Green by the Green Restaurant
Association

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail transmission and any file or previous e-mail attached to it is intended to be
viewed only by the party to which it is addressed and may contain valuable business information that is confidential
and/or otherwise protected from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended recipient you are hereby
notified that any review, disclosure, dissemination or use of any of the information contained in or attached to this
transmission is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. Thank you for your cooperation.

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >
<mailto

> >; Steve Hanson; Richard

Sent: Fri Aug 30 16:37:08 2013
Subject:

lets sign up- asap. if it has notalready been done
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communication in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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