From: I

Sent: Friday, February 13, 2015 4:17 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Did my ct sc=n doctor was very pleased
As the Bone is healing nicely but he di=n't remove the halo he said he will remove it by the end of the month =br> Sent
from my iPhone

On Feb 11, 2015, at 1:15 PM, jeffr=y E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> =gt; wrote:

gre=t news . can you eat ,chew yet?

<=r>

On Wed, Feb 11, 2015 at 7:27 AM, Sultan Bin Su=ayem | . - -

wrote:

Much better on this coming Friday they are taking a ct scan a=d then they might remove the halo so |
am keeping my fingers crossed
S=nt from my iPhone

On Feb 11, 201=, at 12:23 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> >
wrote:

are you betttter?
==
p=ease note

The information contained in this communication is
con=idential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside infor=ation, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communi=ation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If=you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.=om> , and
destroy this commun=cation and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved
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