
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tuesday, December 2, 2014 4:07 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Gregory and Russell 

is =heck still on hold? 
if not should we prorate for 5 days Gregory =ill be away? 

should i wait to pay from =SC interiors which will be open by tomorrow? 
(all previous =onths for gregory and russell were paid via jee =ersonal) 

also is russell fee of 20% or 3,000 =k to pay as well if we prorate gregory should i prorate this =ell too 

please advise 
thank =ou 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 

Subject: rib>Gregory 

Date: November 26, 2014 at 2:15:41 PM =ST 

To: qb>"jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

regarding December fees i would like to remind you =hat Gregory will be away for 5 days in December 
Gregory asked if we =an have check for him next week 
should we send full 15,000 check or =rorate? 
if prorate based on 31 calendar days or 22 reekdays? 

please advise 
thank you 

Richard =ahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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