
From: Heather Gray 
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 9:52 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: RE: Re: 

Oh, I see. Interesting. 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 5:50 PM 
To: Heather Gray 
Subject: Re: 

just as more art to sell . yes. for example sothebys might raise the guarantee, if leon was also giving them works of 
his own. or trust 

On Mon, Apr 24, 2017 at 5:46 PM, Heather Gray 

To the Giacometti deal? 

<mailto: > > wrote: 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtojeevacation@gmail.com> ] 
Sent: Monday, April 24, 2017 5:46 PM 
To: Heather Gray <mailtoe > 
Subject: 

I suggested that leon add some of the artwork of his that he would be willing to sell 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailtoleevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
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