
From: Martin B. O'Connor II • > 
Sent: Friday, January 23, 2015 3:04 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Cc: Peggy Siegal 
Subject: Re: 

Sure. 7 thousand plus (exact figure not at my finger tips presently)re=resents the remaining amount on the distribution 
Try my office after 1130 
M 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 23, 2015, at 5:59 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com> wrote: 

can we speak today. 7 thousandd? 

On Thu, Jan 22, 2015 at 8:04 PM, Martin B. O'Con=or II > &=t; 
wrote: 

Monday 

wrote: 

J 
Working on getting 7 thousand wired and signed document complete=. Should have more to update 

M 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 22, 2015, at 1:34 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@g=ail.com» 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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