
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Sent: Thursday, March 5, 2015 11:17 PM 
To: jeffrey E 
Subject: Re: 

No, because broken up value is over $22M 

BR 

Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 
Tel: 

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Date: Thu, 5 Mar 2015 23:29:22 +0100 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: 

so far no one can guarantee under 15m. . does he want to sell for 20, 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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