From: Erika Kellerhals -

Sent: Thursday, March 9, 2017 7:04 PM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re: Invoices

Particularly in light of the fact that=they are not sure if they are making payroll.
| don't mean to harp o= this - but it's a big amount.

Sent from my iPhone
<=r>0n Mar 9, 2017, at 2:11 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@=mail.com> > wrote:

mu guess is they have not been paying anyon=

On Thu, Mar=9, 2017 at 1:31 PM, Erika Kellerhals _:f_c.pan: wrote:

Erika A.=Kellerhals

Member

=p class="MsoMNormal"=Kellerhals Ferguson Kroblin PLLC
Royal Palm Pr=fessional Building

9053 Estate Thomas, Suite 101=u>

5t. Thomas, VI 00802

|:'.;.x:-

=nbsp; please note

The information con=ained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client priv=leged, may
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for

th= use of the addressee. It is the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, di=closure or copying of this

communication or any part thereof is strictly=prohibited

and may be unlawful. If you have received this

communicati=n in error, please notify us immediately by

return e-mail or by e-mail t= jeevacation@gma=l.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,

inc=uding all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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