From: Richard Kahn W
Sent: Thursday, Marc \ :

To: jeffrey E.

Subject: Re: LS) Mechanic - Evans Frett

on payroll or contractor?
please =dvise
thank you

Richard =ahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fa

ce

On Mar 16, 2017, at 2:25 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

25

On Thu, Mar 16, 2017 at 1:25 PM, =ichard Kahn <[ GG ot

L5) Mechanic search on Evans =rett came back clean

he asked for 530 per hour
Tap currently =arns $18.00 per hour or 37,440

522.50 = 46,800
525.00 = 52,000
527.50==7,200
530.00 = 62,400

karen wanted to meet with him tuesday =o review paperwork and compensation

please advise on compensation and if as =n employee or contractor
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBREK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
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New York, =Y 10022
te
fa
C

Begin forwarded message:

prom: =/b>steve roacruck || R

Subject: =/b=Re: background =heck

Date: =/b>March 16, 2017 at 11:28:35 AM =DT

| have attached my =eports and invoice.

Thank =ou

15, 2017 at 6:34 PM, Richard Kahn =span dir="Itr"
class="">< wrote:

can you please =un for Evans Frett
thank you

<=div>

Richard =ahn

HBREK Associates Inc.
575 Lexington =venue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

fa

ce
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Steve=Roadruck

Roadruck Investigations

11250 Old =aint Augustine Road
Suite 15317

Jack i ' 7
Offi

Fax:

please note

The information contained in this =ommunication is
confidential, may be attorney-client =rivileged, may
constitute inside information, and is =ntended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the =roperty of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure =r copying of this
communication or any part thereof is =trictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have =eceived this
communication in error, please notify us =mmediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this =ommunication and all copies thereof,
including all =ttachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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