
From: 
Sent: Wednesday, August 27, 2014 1:04 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: 

I contacted his CFO. I contacted Apollo accountant handling heri=age and spoke last night. I will call martin kelly today. 
App=rently Kelly met or is to meet with JH to go over the calculations. =The APO distribution Friday will include Q2 '14 
carry and the 2014 carry owed to LDB is $800k. The Apollo accountsnt is wo=king on update 

On Aug 27, 2014, at 8:55 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Josh 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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