From: I

Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2017 10:28 AM
To: jeffrey E.
Subject: Re:

Ohhh i have to be in South Africa at these date for my philanthropic platform
Ariane de Rothschild

On 7 Jun 2017, at 12:18, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

im orgainzing our cuba trip for november. probaly 17-19. lots to see. NO GUILT

On Wed, Jun 7, 2017 at 6:14 AV,
I

Their vitriol is only additional fuel to my determination - | absolutely hate unfairness .
And they are a dead breed

Ariane de Rothschild

On 7 Jun 2017, at 11:34, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> > wrote:

i will not transmit any of cousins vitriol as it seems to upsetyou . NOGUILT !! my new
mantra
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