
From: Harry Fisch < 
Sent: Monday, June 26, 2017 12:25 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: contract with revisions 

Verbally I was told that Arthur Klein'= office will not handle this. Told to speak with Tewari directly. Tewari's 
a=ministrator said that Klein's office didn't want to handle the expenses as t=ey previously agreed. Tewari's admin said 
we should consider no contract, b=t consider private practice at Sinai. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 26, 2017, at 7:46 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeev=cation@gmail.com» wrote: 

yes, but what was the last communic=tion 

On=Mon, Jun 26, 2017 at 7:15 AM, rote: 

 O=iginal Message 
From: harryfisch 
To: jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
Sent: Fri, Feb 10, 2017 2:18 pm 
Subject: Re: contract with revisions 

You are correct. I changed the contract to inc=ude your suggestion (attached). Arthur Klein offered to pay the 
expen=es upfront so that I can pay them and avoid Sinai getting involved. H= recommended it and I like the idea. 

Harry 

 O=iginal Message 
From: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» 
To: Harry Fisch 
Sent: Fri, Feb 10, 2017 12:47 pm 
Subject: Re: contract with revisions 

why salaey increase in place of expenses that w=s not the offer 

On Fri, Feb 10, 2017=at 12:43 PM, <harryfisch@aol.com> wrote: 
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Jeffrey 

Take a look at the contract with my revisions. Let me know what y=u think before I send it back. 

As always, 
Thnaks 

Harry 

PS-look at how I spelled thanks. Am I dyslexic? 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:=eevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

&nbs=; please note 

The information contain=d in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileg=d, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the us= of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclo=ure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly pro=ibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication i= error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.c=m <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
includi=g all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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