
From: LS1 GSJ 
Sent: Wednesday, March 8, 2017 2:39 AM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: Re: Travel 

Hi 
Confirm=ng : 
Once the company she was wor=ing for found out she had breast cancer, terminated her, there was an issue=with 
Medical Insurance, so sued the company. The judge on the case r=led in her favor, Wrongful Termination 
receiving $5,000 as settlement, they=then went on to Cobra Coverage An intruder was coming on to their pr=perty (very 
rural NM) she confronted him with a gun, the intruder took off a=d she called the Police She admit=ed to the Office that 
she had a drink and under NM law it is an offense to b=nish a weapon if alcohol is involved She was changed with 
aggravated assault (confronting him with gun) intox=cation, these charges where dismissed He was a bit taken aback, 
considering all charges where dismissed, surprised it was on her record They di= not even consider this an issue =ill talk 
tomorrow Regards </=iv> 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 7, 2017, at 5:09 PM,=jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.c=m <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com>  wrote: 

lets talk tomorw wife had an aggra=ated assault charge intoxication. and a=wrongful 
terminatino lawsuit. I asked both of them&=bsp; the same questions as dave . not sure what to think .=nbsp; 

On Tue, Mar 7, 2017 at 7:07 PM, LSJ GSJ <As mentioned=in Brice's E Mail shall we book tickets for us to return 
early next week? 

Sent from my iPhone 

The informat=on contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-clie=t privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only fo= 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized u=e, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is st=ictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
commu=ication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-rail to jeevacati=n@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,<=4>including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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