From: Alireza Ittihadieh <

Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2016 9:48 PM
To: jeffrey E.

Subject: RE: 04 2016 G&50

$58-563.5M

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2016 10:47 PM

To: Alireza Ittihadieh

Subject: Re: O4 2016 GE50

prices?

On Wed, May 18, 2016 at 5:45 PM, Alireza Ittihadie
<mailto:

Markets are finally Trading, there are 5 G650's under contract

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail .com= |

Sent: Wednesday, May 18, 2016 10:39 PM

To: Alireza Ittihadieh =
Subject: Re: Q4 2016 G650

i am seeing him fri morning

On Wed, May 18, 2016 at 4:38 PM, Alireza Ittihadieh

What is the Status please?

Best regards,

Alireza Ittihadieh, President & Chief Executive
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please note

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use,
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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