From: Larry Visoski |

Sent: Wednesday, December 3, 2014 2:13 AM
To: Je vacation

Subject: Bell float bags

Jeffrey

An upper state helicopter company c=lled me last week:

Tom Woerlen

Director of Maintenance

=blockquote type="cite">National Helicopters Inc.
<=blockquote>

F
=/blockquote>

www.nationalhelicopters.com <http://www.nationalhe=icopters.com>

Tom asking if we are interested in selling our B430 float bags that are rmoved off your B430.,,

The nitrogen bottle we own has a shelf life until 2015= which is almost timed out., cost to replace is 512,300

The offer to purchas= our float bags and hardware as seen in photo below is 540,000 to you.

| hav=to confirm these bags are in airworthy condition to complete this deal if y=u accept.,

Our floats have been removed for over 5 years and most likely wil= deteriorate just sitting on the shelf in my
office. | have no plans to ins=all the floats on our helicopter due to the weight increase of approximatel= 200lbs.,

Brand new floats cost 5180k from Bell installed with 2 year wait ti=e for parts.,

Do you approve of selling our old floats bags for 540,000.=0 or just keep them?

Thank you

512.3k, which would bring us back to the 550k-ish mark.

In additi=n, if throughout this installation process, it gets determined
that ther= may be a few items still existing on your a/c that we could use,
we wou=d be willing to pay additionally for those if you're willing to take
the= off?

We'd love to make a deal, so please let me know.

Tom Wo=rlen
Director of Maintenance

MNational Helicopters Inc,
P.‘
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www.nationalhelicopters.com <http://www.nationalhel=copters.com>

-----Original M=ssage-----

From: Larry Visoski [mailtﬂ:—-e:mailm- ]

Sent: December-01-14 7:00 PM
To: Tom Woerlen<=r>5ubject: Re: Floats

Hello Tom, I've had a broken Boeing the p=st three days and been extremely
busy., What price are you thinking of o=fering for my floats parts that |
have so | can let my boss know, | thin= it would be helpful if you could

tell me what price you're thinking tha='s fair?

Thx
Larry

Sent from my iPhone
=/spanz

Cheers,

=ffont>

-----0Original Message-----

From: Larry Visoski [mailt::l'.- <mai|to:-]

Sent: November-25-14 7:58 PM

To: Tom Woerlen

EFTA_R1_01418572
EFTA02392035



for&nb=p;

<=blockquote>

<=lockquote type="cite">Hello Tom,.

I just received your voice mail, sorry u missed=your call.

| w=s out flying today, not sure if you knew, we operate a Gulfstream

=/span>

IV and Boeing 727=along with our Bell 430., | met with David Burch

manger at Bell in Fort Lauderdale E=cutive airport yesterday., |

explained you are interested in acquiring my float sys=em, he

c=nfirmed the lead time is up to a year for float system parts,

depending out which p=rts you need., | tried researching my log books

for a part number for my floats to n= avail., David recommended

contacting Bell in Piney Flats to research my float syste=., My serial

=font color="#000000">number B430 is 49078 | attached a photo of the Bell part number

the Mitrog=n blow bottle if this helps., I'm sure there is great

researched involved trying to=find out if this float system will work

on your helicopter., There are some parts s=ill installed on my

Mr Burch=thought a fair price for what | have in parts is in the

550,000.00 range., You can c=ll me anytime tomorrow | am free most of
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the day., at the least, if you wish to pro=eed | would recommend
JEGE, Inc / Jege, LLC
Hyperion Air, LLC

3800 Southern Blvd suite 204

West Palm Bch Fl, 33406

<=lockquote type="cite">

Sent from my iPhone
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