
From: Ann Rodriquez < • 
Sent: Friday, December 5, 2014 6:48 PM 
To: jeffrey E. 
Subject: Fwd: coral stone tiles 

200 pieces ($4,650.00) or 400 pieces ($8,050.00). 

Ann R. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Ann Rodriquez > 
Date: December 5= 2014 at 2:47:18 PM AST 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:je=vacation@gmail.com» 
Subject: Re:=coral stone tiles 

<=iv> 
200 or 400? 

Ann R. 

On Dec 5, 2014, at 2:46 PM, je=frey E. leevacation@gmail.com<=a» wrote: 

<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> 

=et extra 

=a» wrote: 

Just 60 pieces? 

Ann R. 

On Dec 5= 2014, at 2:40 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com 
<mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com» wrote: 

yes for tiles 

<=1"•-

p=ease note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
conridential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside infor=ation, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the prop=rty of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communi=ation or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. lf=you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediat=ly by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.rom> , and 
destroy this commun=cation and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all=rights reserved 

&nb=p; please note 

The information contained in this commun=cation is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
consti=ute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addresse=. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying or this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and ma= be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please n=tify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:j=evacation@gmail.com> , and 
de=troy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachment=. copyright -all rights reserved 
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