
From: Heather Gray <HGray@elysllc.com> 
Sent: Friday, November 14, 2014 4:28 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: RE: art purchases - who arranges payment 

Great — I'll speak with Melanie about it now. Thanks 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.comj 
Sent: Friday, November 14, 2014 11:27 AM 
To: Heather Gray 
Subject: Re: art purchases - who arranges payment 

yes 

On Fri, Nov 14, 2014 at 12:22 PM, Heather Gray > wrote: 

Jeffrey, 

I've been asked by Eileen to tell Melanie that payment for all art purchases - whether made by Leon for his 
personal collection or by Leon on behalf of the children's trusts - should be handled by the family office. 

Currently, Melanie is paying for Leon's art purchases for his personal collection directly out of his bank accounts 
on which she has power of attorney. She sends the family office invoices for purchases being made on behalf of the 
children's trusts so that we can arrange payment for those. 

I just want to confirm that you and Leon want payment for all art purchases to be handled by the family office. 

Thanks, 

Heather 
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Heather Gray 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 

New York, New York 10022 

please note 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may constitute 
inside information, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of JEE Unauthorized use, 
disclosure or copying of this communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jeevacation@gmail.com <mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com> , and destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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