
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Saturday, April 30, 2016 8:02 PM 
To: Jeffrey Epstein 
Subject: Fwd: Stone walls proposal 

After last email vendor is now d=wn to 98,000 from 147,640. Number still seems overstated by 20-25k. </=iv> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc.=/div> 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Zorro Ranch <zdc.rt41@gmail.com <mailto:zdc.rt41=gmail.com» 
Date: April 30, 2016 at 12:=1:14 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: ZDC <zorro.office@gmail.com> 
Subject:=/b> Re: Stone walls proposal 

Rich 
Jose 
Is propo=ing 98k for stone walls 
This includes labor and material <=span> 
Price quoted is for either large or small walls 
<=pan>He will forward written proposal tomorrow 

<=pan> 

Rich 
Firstly he confirmed that after doing several mock ups the time fram= to complete job would be in 10-12 weeks 

instead of the 6 week he initially=indicated 
Jose will review his bid and will forward it this=weekend 
I will review and forward 
Thx 

Sent from my iPhone 
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2:49 P=, Richard Kahn 
> wrote: 

<=pan> 

ok 
</=lockquote> 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 

New York, NY 10022 

</=pan> 

=blockquote type="cite">Sent from my iPhone 
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<=blockquote> 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

575 Lexington Avenue 4=h Floor 

On Apr 28, 2016, at 2:23 PM, Zorro Ranch <zdc.rt41@gmail.com <mailto:=dc.rt41@gmailcom» wrote: 

</=pan> 

Rich 

<Mockquote> 

Attached revised proposal for d=ystack stone walls for the EGP 

Irrigation and plant mat=rial will 

<=lockquote type="cite">Be forwarded tomorrow 

I w=uld like to discuss stone work and decide upon direction 
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Please advise when you have time to do so 

=blockquote type="cite"> 

Richard Kahn 
=span style="background-color: rgba(255, 255, 255, 0);">HBRK Associates In=. 
attached estimates, stone writs, plant material and irrigation for the EGP 

Walls- $147,640.00 
=font color="#000000">Plant Material- $15672.10 
Irrigation Parts- $2539.85 

Wil= call at 10 am 
Brice Gordon 
Stanley, NM 
=/font> 

<=lockquote type="cite"> 

Sent from my iPhone 
<=blockquote> 
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