From: seils ciein |

Sent: Thursday, December 16, 2010 8:29 PM
To: jeevacation@gmail.com

Subject: Dr Thomas Magnani

Attachments: SKMBT_C25310121616150.pdf

Attached please find invoices for :nbsp;-uisit on Nov 22 and December 13 for 51425,.i5it on Nov 24
for 5210, and your =isit on Nov 19 for 5195

Please approve for payment,
Thank you,

Bella

From:=/b>
Sent: Thursday, December 16, 2010 4:16 PM
To: Bella Klein

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253

EFTA_R1_01427933
EFTA02396093



