
From: Richard Kahn <MMIN IMI 
Sent: Thursday, December 11, 2014 3:02 PM 
To: Jeffrey E. 
Subject: 

is asking if ok to send her 2,000 monthly =ee for dec 15 in addition she has 161.95 left for expenses such as 
=web hosting & press releases) she is asking for a 2,000 =xpense advance as well please advise if ok to send =,000 thank 
you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates =nc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 

Subject: =/b>Dec 15th =ire 

Date: =/b>December 10, 2014 at =:02:56 PM EST 

To: =/b 
</=iv> 
Reply-To 

Hi Rich, 

=Tyler Shears 

I've updated the =xpense sheet-- thank you for sending a check for Dec 15th along with an =dditional $2000 for 
upcoming expenses. I don't anticipate anything =ajor at this point except for website renewals-- but like to have a 
=ushion in advance. 

I'm still waiting to hear from Tyler, who said that he had a =eath in his family. Hence the delay. He said that he 
spoke with Jeffrey =nd will be sending him and me a summary of how we are moving =orward. 

In the meantime, I am getting the main website transferred, =pdating content and inputting submenus to make 
google display the menus =n their search page. 
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Thank you 
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